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dirtandloose earthgetting into them. Ploughs of everydescription
inendless variety areshown,and,needless to pay, areacredit to this
firm. The mould boards are all now made in duplicate, thus
enabling the farmer torenew the boards himself without goingto
theblacksmith's. Grubbers,rollors.double drills,drays chaffcutters,
etc., are shownin abundance. Claytou and Shuttleworth's thresh-
ing mill (at work)is another attractive feature,and is fitted with
patent divided blast and front discharge, and the screens are larger
than formerly. It is also fitted witha turnover straw elevator.
Burrell's traction engine, with enlarged firebox and loose winding
drum, is an important feature of this stand. A new departurefor
this firm to make is in the direction of a large marquee filled with
bicycles from the well-known English makers Rudge-Whit worth,
for whichReid and Gray are sole agents for the South Island. A
collection of sundries,comprisingmill fittings,leather beltings, wire
btrainers, fencing standards,binder twine,oils, rasps, etc.,completes
the exhibits in this stand.

NIMMO AND BLAIR.
The exhibit of Messrs Nimmo and Blair is an extensiveone,and

comprises "Standard" seeds of various sorts, manures,binder twine,
cocoanut oilcake, restorine, lactina, and the now well known''PlanetJr.' implements,besides other machinery for agricultural
purposes. Although everything is

"
for exhibitiononly,"and not-

withstanding the fact that theseeds have hadnospecialpreparation
for show, being just whatare soldby them in the ordinary wayof
commerce, the highquality of the seeds is apparent to the close
observer. The varieties shown are only those mo'-t largely usedby
the agriculturist, andconsist of ryegrass,cocksfoot, clovers,fescue,
turnip, and other seeds. Manures exhibited are their celebrated
"Standard

"
bonemanure (which, since theresults of the trials held

by the Agricultural and Pastoral Society, has always had a large
demand), Lawes's superphosphates, Cross's superphosphates,and
Anglo-Continental dissolved guano. Chief among the exhibitsof
implements are the various

"PUnetJr." machines, theseranging in
size from the two-horse riding harrow and cultivator down to the
various email handmachines. The ridingharrow andcultivator is
the latest novelty from the

'"
PlanetJr." work?, and consequently

attract considerable attention. It is fitted with nine cultivator
teeth adjustable to anyposition on tbe frame;it can also be made
into a driller,opening up three drills at a time,and with thevarious
attachments which fit on to this machine a great variety of farm
work can be done ;and the riding harrow and cultivator bids fair
to equal in popularity the better known and smaller '"

PlanetJr."
horse hoe. Additional implements bhown are

"
Advance

"
chilled

ploughs, LeButt's seed drills, Cahoon seed sower-", etc.,and to all
interested inlabour-saving tools an inspectionof Mes&rs Nimmo and
Blair's exhibits will be found of value.

INTERESTING MARRIAGE CEREMONY IN
AUCKLAND.

A marriage crremonyof more than ordinnry interest was solemn-
ised under bright and happy auspices,enhanced by theblessingsand
"roodoffices or our Holy Church, :it St. Patrick's Cathedral on Wed-
nesday,November 17. The contracting parties,Mr. Daniel Flynn
art'l Miss Mary Mahon^y, are well known and widely respected for
their many and sterling quriliuc. eminently characteristic in the
goodCatholic. On ihe eventfulmorning at 10 o'clock the bridal
party entered the church. Mr.William Mthoney (one of our most
respected citizen;-), fathrr of the bride, led her to the rails. The
bridesmaids were Miss Nor.ih Mahoney, si-ter of the bride, Miss
Flynn, sister of the bridegroom, and Misses Nellie and Katie
Mahoney,younger sisters of the bride,and Misses Mary and Nellie
Flynn. Mr.P.Flynn, brother of the bridegroom, wasbest man,and
with him Master James Mahoney. There were also present Mes-
daines Mahoney and FJynn,mother of the bride and bridegroom ;
VeryRev. Fa her O'Reilly, P.P.. Tha-res ;Rev. Fr. Ilackett, P.P.,
Paeroa,Fr. Gillan, Pon-onby ;Fr. Brodi*>, St. Benedict's; and Fr.
Buckley,St. Patrick's. Father Croke celebrated the nuptial Mass,
during which the happy couple received Holy Communion. John
and Edmund Mahoney, brothers of thebride, answered Mass, at the
conclusion of which the holy sacrament of matrimony was
solemnly performed by Father Croke. In its every detail it was
thoroughly Catholic, and now-a-days whenso little is made by the
unthoughtful of this important and sacred function, it is worthy of
record. At the termination of the ceremony the party left the
Cathedral, which was well filled, for the residence of Mr. Win.
Mahoney, where a sumptuous breakfast was in readiness. The
company whicheat down consisted of all those mentioned above,
andMr. andMrs. Butler, Mr. Barry,Mr. andMrs.Lawless, Paeroa;
Mr.and Mrs. James O'Brien, and Mr. John Patterson, J.P. After
breakfastFathers O'Reilly, Hackett,Gillan, andBrodie, andMessrs.
Corbett and Pattersonspokein eulogistic terms of the happy pair,
and referred to the highly edifying spectacle theyhad just wit-
nessed,and which would, assuredly be attended with the best and
happiestresults.

The bride was neatly attired in white figured llama, veilwith
orange blossoms, and hat to match. The bridesmaids, Misses
Mahoney and Flynn, were dressed in shower of hail, as werealso
Misses M.and N.Flynn. MissesN. andK. Mahoney in whitesilk.

The presents werenumerous andcostly,andof a decidedly use-
fulcharacter. An uncle of the bride presentedher witha cheque
for £100. Inthe afternoon the newly-married pair took train for
the Waikato, where thehoneymoon was spent.

One andall wish them God's choicest blessings and favour?,and
long yearsofusefulness andhappiness to whichthey havelaid claim
by reasonof theirexemplary lives.

ANNUAL SUMMER SHOW.

The twenty-first summer show of the above Society \\ as held at
Tahuna Park last Wednesday and Thursday. There was a large
attendanceof visitors from all partsof the country and the town
people were also very largely represented, fully 14,000 persons
being on the grounds on Thursday afternoon. The show of sheep,
cattle,andhorses, though not as numerous as last year wasstill in
point of quality up to the usual standard. The implements
exhibited weremuch morenumerous thanlast year, every possible
class of farming machinery being shown. The following is a
detailedaccount of someof the principalexhibits :—:

—
MASSEY-HAItRIS COY.(LIMITED)

As at last year's show, this company's exhibit is up to its usual
high standardof excellence. The quality of the machines exhibited
and the completenessof the arrangement?of thjsamecould not.bo
surpassed. Chief among the exhibits are the wide open reapers and
binders of the company which are now known nilover the globe.
and this year have the advantage of roller and bull bearings, which
makes the draught very easy. Farmers should make a point <,f
inspecting the above improvementsas they are a gre.it advantage to
the binder. They also show Imperial Reapers, Brantford one and
twohorse mowers, hayrakers withsteel wheels, hay tedder.?, turnip
pulpers,single,double, trebleand four furrow ploughs and scufners
withone and two long levers and long hillers. The binder, as well
as several other machines, are shown inuiction, and attracted a
large number of visitors from the country who seemed to be
thoroughly sati.-fiud that the machines wcie all that they were
represented to bi«. Another useful implement exhibited was the
Massey-Harris cultivator, which is now verylargely used through-
out the country,and also their famous grain drills with I."j a»'d li>
Bhoes. One gieat advantage of the perfected roller and ball bear-
ingsin the binders and mowers is thatitreduces the friction which
increases as the supply of oil decrease?. The sale of the firm's
implements has now assumed enormous proportionsand they have
become favourites with the whole farming community. A quantity
of oil was also shown. Within the last twoyears this firm have
gone into thebicycle butdness, andas withall their other machines,
their bicycles are of the very best quality and the excellent display
made by the firm is a standing proof of the popularity these
machines have already gained. The success of the Massey-Harris
bicycle since its introduction provesit tobe a highgradebicycle in
point of construction, material, design and finish. The whole
exhibitof this firm reflected great credit on the management as it
was inevery wayinteresting and complete. Representativesof the
firm were on the ground, and with their usual courtesyexplained
the full working of theabove implements andbicycles.

KEIDAND GEAY.
As usual, this firm'sstand is repletewith everykind of modern

machinery. Chief among their exhibits is the Deering
"

Pony"
and" All Steel

"
harvesters and binders (for which the firm are sole

agents). These binders are specially built for the New Zealand
market, and will handle both long or short grain equally well,
they are fitted with ball and roller bearings. Being shown in
motion, they attractagreatdealof attention. The Deering '"

Ideal
"

mowers,also fitted withball androller bearings, are on view. A11-
inch four roller double chaffcutter and bagger is worthy of notice,
andis fitted withpatent reversing gear. Their Eureka seed turnip
andmanuredrillsalsoreceive favourablecomment. Steel and wood
frame diss harrows of allsizes are fitted withall the latest improve-
ments,one special feature on both harrows being that they were
drawnfrom the epds,whicheffectuallyprotects thebearingsagainst

A tragedianrecentlyplaying Richard 111., in a small provincial
town,was waitedonafter the show by anhonest farmer, who said
that "if the gen'l'man who wanted ahorse was still in the same
mindhe would like todobusiness with him."
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AN AMBIGUOUS OFFER.

Some of the expressions used in sport (says a writer in ar
exchange) are abit confusing. A party of cyclists were starting
for a run, andone of the young ladies who was abh late— ladies
sometimes are.when. when preparing for an outing

—
was left behind.

Finally a cyclist, with whom she was distantly acquainted, came
along, and hearing the taleof woe, said, '"Oh,don't bother about
them. You coma with me, and we'll soon catchup. 11lnurseyou
all right." ''Excuse me, but you'll do nothing of the kind," said
the lady withsome firmness. '■Idon't allow married men to nurse
me." The poor, confus-ed man had to explainhurriedly, through
his blushes, exactly whatnursing meant in cycleracing language.
Iam not quite sure whatitdoes mean, but itdoesn't meannursing
in thesense understoodeither in family circles or at seaside picnics.

HE SPOILT THE SEMIOX.
A good story is told (says a writer in the Auntl'dliis'ian") by a

correspondent,to whomIhave beenpreviously indebted,of a clergy-
man well knownin the Western district — a manof mont orthodox
views,anauthority onChurch statistics, and yet somewhat resemb-
ling Eli in the management of his family. Being a veryclose
reader, it washis usual plan before leaving hisstudy for thepulpit,
to take one final look athis sermon, tosee that his mischievous son
hadnot beenathisfavourite trick of "nicking a leaf

"
from theMS.

and thereby destroying the thread of the discourse. Once bitten,
the reverend gentleman hadevers-ince been on his guard. He was
announced to re-deliver,ina neighbouring township, his pet sermon
on temperance. All went well till the peroration,when he asked
the momentous question:"And what is necessary to enable us to
attain to this hi»h ideal of humanity ?" Then,after an oratorical
pause,he furnished the answer himself in the following words :—:

—"Nothing butspirituous stimulants ?" The erring and irreverent
son was answerable for the change of the original

"spiritual
stimulus

"
into the more familiar

"' spirituousstimulants."
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